
 

Govind Cable Industries 

 
 Amount  Rating Action 

 Rs. Crore December 2016 

Fund-based Limits - Long Term 6.00  
(enhanced from 5.00) 

[ICRA] B; reaffirmed 

Non-fund based Limits - Short Term 7.00 
 (enhanced from 5.00) 

[ICRA] A4; reaffirmed 

 13.00  
 
ICRA has reaffirmed its long-term rating of [ICRA]B (pronounced ICRA B) and short-term rating of [ICRA]A4 
(pronounced ICRA A four) on the Rs. 13.00-crore(enhanced from Rs. 10.00 crore)  bank facilities of Govind 
Cable Industries (GCI).   
 
ICRA’s ratings continue to derive comfort from the long track record of the partners in the cables industry and 
the firm’s established relationships with its customers, including Bharat Heavy Electricals Limited (BHEL) and 
NTPC Limited. ICRA also draws comfort from the healthy order book position of the firm, which gives a healthy 
near term revenue visibility. 
 
The ratings are, however, constrained by GCI’s modest scale of operations and the highly competitive and 
fragmented nature of the industry it operates in, with the presence of numerous players in both organised and 
unorganised sectors. The ratings also take into account the firm’s dependence on Government-related orders, 
as well as its exposure to high customer concentration risks, with ~45% of its operating income derived from 
BHEL, which results in an elongated receivables cycle and keeps its operations working capital intensive. GCI’s 
stretched liquidity position is reflected by its almost fully utilised working capital limits. ICRA’s ratings also factor 
in the susceptibility of the firm’s profitability to raw material price fluctuations, given the large quantum of fixed 
price nature of orders, which may dampen the margins of the firm. Furthermore, the constitution of the entity as 
a partnership firm also renders it susceptible to capital withdrawals by the partners, which could adversely 
impact its credit metrics. 
 
Going forward, GCI’s ability to grow at a healthy growth rate while maintaining profitability and maintaining 
adequate liquidity will be the key rating sensitivities. 
 
Firm Profile  
Govind Cable Industries (GCI) was established in 1978 to manufacture power, control and instrumentation 
cables mainly for steel and power sectors. The firm caters to Government entities or private dealers who supply 
to Government entities. The manufacturing facility is located at the industrial area of Sahibabad in Ghaziabad, 
Uttar Pradesh. 
 
Recent Results 
GCI, reported an operating income of Rs.21.88 crore in FY2016 and a net profit of Rs.0.22 crore, as against an 
operating income of Rs.19.17 crore and a net profit of Rs.0.21 crore in FY2015.  
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